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Introduction: 

March 24, 2017 
Accrediting Commission for Community and Junior Colleges 
Willard Lewallen, Team Chair 
Team Report of Follow-Up Visit Team to Napa Valley College, March 24, 2017 

A comprehensive evaluation team visit was conducted at Napa Valley College in September­
October 2015. At its meeting of January 6-8, 2016 the Commission took action to require Napa 
Valley College to submit a Follow-Up Report by March 15, 2017 and that this report would be 
followed by a visit of Commission representatives. The Commission found that the College was 
out of compliance with the following Eligibility Requirements and Standards: ER 11; I.B.2; 
II Tm
(ER )3er i n  





Team Analysis of College Responses to the 2015 Evaluation Team Recommendations 

Recommendation 1: In order to meet the Standards, the team recommends that the College fully 
engage in a broad-based dialogue that leads to the identification of Student Learning Outcomes 
at the course, program, and degree levels, and that leads to regular assessment of student 
progress toward achievement of the outcomes. The team further recommends that, in order to 
meet the Standards, the College develop student learning outcomes and assessment that is 
ongoing, systematic, and used for continuous quality improvement, where student learning 
improvement in all disciplines is a visible priority in all practices and structures across the 
College. The team further recommends that training be provided for all personnel in the 
development and assessment of learning outcomes at the course, program, institution and service 
levels. (Standards I.B.2, Il.A.3; ER 11) 

Findings and Evidence: Napa Valley College has ·made significant improvements over the last 
18 months to address concerns cited within Recommendation 1. The College has improved 
outcomes assessment through identifying learning outcomes for most courses, programs, degrees 
and certificates, and academic support services and assessing outcomes more regularly in each 
area. The College has also made progress in using assessment results through tools such as 
assessment plans and assessment results templates to improve the quality of dialogue, through 
dedicated opportunities, such as Flex Day and regular division meetings. In order to ensure that 
CLOs are listed correctly on course syllabi, the College has developed a review process and a 
Congruency Certification form. Napa Valley College has also created more professional 
development opportunities, both internal and external, surrounding assessment. And finally, the 
College has committed resources ( e.g., 80% reassigned time for two Learning Outcomes 
Assessment Faculty Coordinators) and developed practices to ensure that all of these 
improvements are being institutionalized so that they may be sustained over time. 

Most learning outcomes have been identified and assessed across the College. As of January 
2017, 96% of courses, 97% of degree and certificate programs, and 100% of Academic Support 
Services had outcomes identified. The College now has a more formal process to document and 
track assessment and to calculate the proportion of courses engaged in ongoing assessment and 
has also established a 6-year assessment cycle to create better consistency in outcomes 
assessment reporting. As of February 2017, 87% of courses, 100% of degree and certificate 
programs, and 100% of Academic Support Services had outcomes assessed. The majority of 
courses that have not been assessed are courses that have not been offered in recent years. The 
Curriculum Committee is working on revising the process to archive or assess courses still in the 
catalog, but that have not been offered in the last 6 o0.114 0.11o0.0089 Tc -0797t50 Td
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administrative/confidential and classified employees. The College is currently in negotiations 
with the faculty union to strengthen the performance 






